Eastham - Dredge Rock Harbor
Bid Opening April 2, 2014 at 2 PM

Item

Base Bid - basin

Timber Pile R/R

Timber pile - oak

Timber pile - Greenheart
Mob/Demob

mech dredge clam
Debris disposal

Special debris dis

Alternate 1 - channel
Timber Pile R/R

Timber pile - oak

Timber pile - Greenheart
mech dredge clam
Debris disposal

Special debris dis

Alternate 2 - basin
Mech dredge env bucket

Alternate 3- Channel
mech dredge env bucket

Alternate 4 - Basin
Hydraulic Dredge

Alternate 5 - channel
Hydraulic Dredge

Alternate 6-
Turbidity Curtain
Cashman, Synagro

Prepared by: C. Andres
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Coastline

68,400.00 S
6,000.00 $
30,000.00 $
100,000.00 $
685,260.00
1,500.00 $
1,200.00 S
892,360.00

9,600.00 S
4,800.00 S
24,000.00 $
383,380.00 S
3,750.00 $
1,200.00 S
426,730.00 S

799,470.00
442,870.00
no bid

no bid

5,000.00 $

Burnham

102,600.00
22,000.00
33,000.00

600,000.00

$ 1,015,200.00

600.00
500.00

$ 1,773,900.00

14,400.00
11,000.00
16,500.00
528,800.00
1,500.00
500.00
572,700.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

4,000.00

Robert Our

$ 70,680.00
S 23,000.00
S 32,000.00
$ 580,000.00
$ 979,668.00
$ 1,000.00
S 600.00
$ 1,686,948.00
S 9,920.00
$ 11,500.00
S 16,000.00
$ 505,004.00
$ 2,500.00
$ 600.00
$ 545,524.00
$ 996,165.00
$ 515,580.00
$ 1,370,520.00
$ 713,880.00
$ 3,600.00




